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  Join us for a 30-minute briefing covering several Executive Compensation practice
topics. The program is the first in a new series of quarterly webcasts designed to provide
quick insights into emerging issues and practical advice. Topics discussed:

Learn about current practices in private company management compensation

Get up to speed on emerging public company compensation trends and top areas
of focus for Compensation Committees

Be prepared for compensation-related litigation and enforcement trends

PANELISTS: Krista Hanvey is Co-Chair of Gibson Dunn’s Employee Benefits and
Executive Compensation practice group and Co-Partner in charge of the firm’s Dallas
office. She counsels clients of all sizes across all industries, both public and private, using
a multi-disciplinary approach to compensation and benefits matters that crosses tax,
securities, labor, accounting and traditional employee benefits legal requirements. Ms.
Hanvey has significant experience with all aspects of executive compensation, health and
welfare benefit plan, and retirement plan compliance, planning, and transactional support.
She also routinely advises clients with respect to general corporate and non-profit
governance matters. Ms. Hanvey also oversees the Dallas office’s pro bono adoption
program. Michael Collins is a partner in the Washington, DC office of Gibson, Dunn &
Crutcher. His practice focuses on all aspects employee benefits and executive
compensation. His practice runs the full gamut of tax, ERISA, accounting, corporate, and
securities law aspects of stock option, SAR, restricted stock, and employee stock
purchase plans; tax-qualified retirement plans, nonqualified deferred compensation;
SERPs; executive employment agreements, golden parachutes and other change in
control arrangements; severance, confidentiality, and noncompete contracts; performance
bonus and incentive plans; director's pay; rabbi trusts; split dollar life insurance; excess
benefit and top hat plans; and the like. He represents both executives and companies in
drafting and negotiating employment arrangements. Ekaterina (Kate) Napalkova is a
partner in the New York office of Gibson, Dunn & Crutcher and a member of the Employee
Benefits and Executive Compensation Practice Group. Kate advises public and private
companies, private investment funds, boards of directors and management teams on a
broad range of compensation and employee benefits matters. Her advice focuses on the
compensation and employee benefits aspects of mergers and acquisitions, restructurings,
public offerings, spin-offs and other corporate transactions. She is experienced in the
negotiation and implementation of benefit and compensation plans, as well as
compensation-related securities reporting and corporate governance matters. John
Curran is an associate in the New York office of Gibson, Dunn & Crutcher. He is a
member of the firm’s Corporate Department and a member of the firm’s Executive
Compensation and Employee Benefits Practice Group. His practices focuses on all
aspects of executive compensation and employee benefits, including tax, ERISA,
accounting, corporate, and securities law aspects of equity and other incentive
compensation plans, qualified and nonqualified retirement and deferred compensation
plans and executive employment and severance arrangements, including in connection
with complex domestic and international business transactions. Prior to joining Gibson,
Dunn & Crutcher, John was a corporate associate in the Executive Compensation Group
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at Davis Polk & Wardwell in New York, where he advised clients on equity-based incentive
compensation, employment, severance plans and other executive compensation
arrangements. 
MCLE CREDIT INFORMATION: This program has been approved for credit in
accordance with the requirements of the New York State Continuing Legal Education
Board for a maximum of 0.5 credit hour, of which 0.5 credit hour may be applied toward
the areas of professional practice requirement. This course is approved for transitional/non-
transitional credit. Gibson, Dunn & Crutcher LLP certifies that this activity has been
approved for MCLE credit by the State Bar of California in the amount of 0.5 hour. Gibson,
Dunn & Crutcher LLP is authorized by the Solicitors Regulation Authority to provide in-
house CPD training. This program is approved for CPD credit in the amount of 0.5 hour.
Regulated by the Solicitors Regulation Authority (Number 324652). Neither the
Connecticut Judicial Branch nor the Commission on Minimum Continuing Legal Education
approve or accredit CLE providers or activities. It is the opinion of this provider that this
activity qualifies for up to 0.5 hour toward your annual CLE requirement in Connecticut,
including 0 hour(s) of ethics/professionalism. Application for approval is pending with the
Colorado, Illinois, Texas, Virginia and Washington State Bars. © 2024 Gibson, Dunn &
Crutcher LLP.  All rights reserved.  For contact and other information, please visit us at
www.gibsondunn.com. Attorney Advertising: These materials were prepared for general
informational purposes only based on information available at the time of publication and
are not intended as, do not constitute, and should not be relied upon as, legal advice or a
legal opinion on any specific facts or circumstances. Gibson Dunn (and its affiliates,
attorneys, and employees) shall not have any liability in connection with any use of these
materials.  The sharing of these materials does not establish an attorney-client relationship
with the recipient and should not be relied upon as an alternative for advice from qualified
counsel.  Please note that facts and circumstances may vary, and prior results do not
guarantee a similar outcome.
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